LAW AND JUDICIARY DEPARTMENT

Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk, Mantralaya,
Mumbai 400 032, dated the 5th July 2021.

NOTIFICATION

SHREE SAl BABA SANSTHAN TRUST (SHIRDI) AcT, 2004.

No. SSV 2021/C.R. 118/Desk-16.— In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (b) of section
8, sub-section (2) of section 13 and sub-sections (/) and (2) and the proviso to sub-section (3) of
section 25 of the Shree Sai Baba Sansthan Trust (Shirdi) Act, 2004 (Mah. XIV of 2004); and of all
other powers enabling it in that behalf, the Government of Maharashtra, after being satisfied that,
circumstances exist which render it necessary to take immediate action and to dispense with the
condition of previous publication under the proviso to sub-section (3) of the said section 23, hereby
makes the following rules to amend the Shree Sai Baba Sansthan Trust (Shirdi) (Appointment of

Members of Management Committee and Forms of Declarations) Rules, 2013, namely :—

1. These rules may be called the Shree Sai Baba Sansthan Trust (Shirdi) (Appointment of

Members of Management Committee and Forms of Declarations) (Amendment) Rules, 2021.

2. In rule 5 of the Shree Sai Baba Sansthan Trust (Shirdi) (Appointment of Members of
Management Committee and Forms of Declarations) Rules, 2013 (hereinafter referred to as ‘“the

principal Rules™), clause (h) shall be deleted.

3. In the Schedule of the principal Rules, —

(a) in entry at serial No. 1, in column No. (3), for the words “ten years” the words “five years”
shall be substituted;
(b) in entry at serial No. 2, —
(i) against category, Business Management, etc., in column No. (3), for the words “ten

years”, wherever they occur, the words “five years” shall be substituted,

(ii) against category, Public Administration, in column No. (3), for the words “ten

vears” the words “five years” shall be substituted;




(c) in entry at serial No. 3,—

(i) against category, Engineering, in column No. (3), for the portion beginning with
the words “Bachelor of Engineering” and ending with the words “Engineering
activities”, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Bachelor of Engineering (B. E.) from a recognized University or Diploma in
Engineering, with a minimufn experience of five years in Engineering
activities™;

(ii)  against category, Architecture, in column No. (3), for the words, brackets and
letter “*Bachelor of Architecture (B.Arch.) with minimum ten years practice”
the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Bachelor of Architecture (B.Arch.) from a recognized University or
Diploma in Architecture, with a minimum experience of five years in

Architecture activities’;

(d) in entry at serial No. 4, in column No. (3), for the words “ten years” the words “five years”
shall be substituted;
(e) in entry at serial No. 5, in column No. (3). for the words “ten years” the words “five years™

shall be substituted.
By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SANJAY ANANDRAO DESHMUKH,
Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATICNERY AND PUBLICATION. PRINTED AND PUBLISHED B8Y DIRECTOR.
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBA! 400 CC4 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AMD PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH RCAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITCR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.




